
  

FRIDAY, JANUARY 20, 2017 

 
 

Monday 

 No School 
 

Tuesday  

 Girls Basketball @ WHS vs. Winfield 
 

Wednesday 

 Boys Chaparral Tournament 6:00 
 
Thursday 

 Wrestling @ WHS 6:00 
 

Friday 

 Boys Chaparral Tournament TBD 

 Drama Play 7:00 
 

Saturday 

 Boys Chaparral Tournament TBD 

 Drama Play 7:00 

 
 

TODAY'S LUNCH 
Choice of: 

Tony's Pizza 

Parmesan Chicken Sandwich 

 

Monday's Breakfast 

Pancakes 

 

Monday's Lunch 
Choice of: 

Chicken Nuggets 

Hot Dog Mac and Cheese 

 

•  Today’s News    • 
 

 
*Special K will be dismissed at 11 to eat lunch. They 
are marked Activity. 
 
*The Crusaders of the Stage Thespian Showcase 
production of Unexpected Tenderness is today and 
tomorrow at 7:00 pm. Student tickets are $4.00. 
Don't miss this touching Drama about a 
dysfunctional family. 
 
* Crusader Creators will have their next meeting on 
Monday January 23rd at 5:30. 
 
*The Sibyl K. Wells Scholarship was established by 
Sibyl Wells. It was Mrs. Wells wish to provide 

scholarships which would benefit students from 
Wellington High School who will attend a Christian 
College or University. The applications are in the 
counseling office and the deadline to turn in this 
application is March 1. Any senior who is planning on 
attending a Christian college or university, please 
come to the counseling office to get an application 
form. 
 
* The Southwestern College Full Tuition Scholarship 
deadline is this Friday, January 20, 2017. 
 
*TODAY is the last day to turn in your T-shirt order 
forms and payment for White Out Night on Friday, 
February 10th at the home basketball games.  
 
*Are you running late and missed breakfast in the 
cafeteria? You can now stop by the cafeteria 
between 1st and 2nd hour for a breakfast boat! 

 

Guidance Office News 
College Visits During Lunch: 

January 23- Hutchinson CC 

January 24- Marine Visit 

February 7th- Cowley College 

February 13- Fort Hays 

 

 

Faculty Bulletin 

 
Today is..... 

 National Cheese Lover' s Day 


